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This paper provides a background to the need for student instruction in 
digital literacy and for a digital pedagogy to be adopted when teaching this 
type of content. As many university courses in Japan lack these classes, a 
detailed explanation of the causative factors for their relative absence from 
academia in Japan and a rationale for their inclusion are necessary. After 
such a background introduction of the educational technology issue in Japan, 
this report then highlights the digital literacy approach taken by the author 
in introducing this content into his classes. Particular attention is paid to the 
range and type of digital literacy tools and the actual techniques taught to 
contribute to creating a learning community of students as well as to the 
pedagogy and methodology that underpinned this approach. Finally, 
recommendations for the future implementation of these types of courses 
and content are given.  

INTRODUCTION TO EDUCATIONAL TECHNOLOGY IN JAPAN

In the period since the public popularity of the Internet in the 1990s, 
educational technology has been on an exponential curve of growth in terms of 
the range, power, and types of tools available. However, easy availability of 
technology has not always lead to its adoption by schools and universities in 
Japan, a country notorious for its rote-based learning (Rohlen & LeTendre, 1998, 
p. 7). Given the high numbers of universities in Japan on a per capita basis, 783 
universities in a country with approximately 120 million people compared with 
the UK, with roughly half the population but only 163 universities (Higher 
Education Statistics Agency, 2013; Tanikawa, 2013), very few make the world 
rankings. According to the latest Times Higher Education World Rankings the 
highest ranking Japanese university is the University of Tokyo at number 46 
(down from 23 in 2013), followed by Kyoto University at 74 (down from 52 in 
2013). That is only two universities in the top 200 according to the Times, 
(World university rankings 2013―2014: Times higher education, 2013; World 
university rankings, 2017) and not a good advertisement for the quality of 
Japanese education, given their numbers.  

In 2003, the Economist Intelligence Unit conducted an e-Learning Readiness 
index and ranked Japan as being 23rd (Suzuki, 2009), shocking many in Japan 
and contributing to the changes that came as a result of the so called “Big Bang” 
in Japanese education under then Prime Minister Koizumi (Eades, Goodman, & 
Hada, 2005). This did not result in any major changes as by 2009 Japan was still 
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only ranked 22nd, this despite being ranked 2nd in 2007 in the Digital 
Opportunity Index, which measures digital connectivity of societies (International 
Telecommunications Union, 2007, p. 36). Even now non-Japanese employers (and 
some forward-thinking Japanese employers) frequently complain about the lack of 
information technology (IT) and information communication technology (ICT) 
skills in their newly hired, newly graduated Japanese employees (Otoshi, quoted 
in Bachnik, as cited in Eades et al., 2005, p. 276). Here, these corporations are 
seeing the results of the “blank slate” graduates preferred by traditional Japanese 
corporations in the recent past (Aspinall, 2010, p. 10; McVeigh, 2002, pp. 123–
147). This has not prompted any major rush to improve as Japan has only stated 
it will introduce things like tablet devices in elementary schools by 2020 (Ministry 
of Internal Affairs and Communications [MIC] Japan, 2013) when that date was 
further away in the future than the length of time that iPads (the most popular 
tablet devices) had been in existence. So the education authorities seem more 
concerned with preserving the past than looking to the future, a position that 
Aspinall attributes to Japan being a risk averse society (Aspinall, 2010, pp. 12–17).

Traditionally the Japanese education model was referred to as 
“education/examination hell” (Haberman, 1988; McVeigh, 2002, Chapter 4). In 
the post-war period until very recently, most Japanese university students wanted 
to be hired by a prestigious (read “traditional”) corporation, and if they achieved 
this, they were relatively satisfied, as employment with a Japanese corporation 
included generous working conditions and a job for life. However, to get hired by 
big name corporations meant they had to first gain admittance to a big-name 
university. What subjects were studied at university was relatively unimportant to 
employers compared to the actual rank and reputation of the university. So 
getting into a prestigious university was and still is all-important as gakubatsu 
(exclusive university cliques for students and former students from certain 
departments) had and still do have influence for graduates seeking jobs (Johnson, 
1982, Chapter 2; Ramseyer, 2010, pp. 2–3).

To get into such a name university, students, in theory at least, had to pass 
the university’s rigorous entrance examination. However, this was only rigorous in 
terms of the amount of data needed to be memorized to pass the test; critical 
thinking and creativity were not factors at all, and even today, this continues to 
be the case in these memory-centric entrance tests for the most part. In turn, a 
lucrative industry has developed whereby some juku (cram schools specializing in 
university entrance test preparation) have developed a reputation for preparing 
students to pass these tests for particular universities. However to avoid the 
competition of these difficult tests some students try to be accepted via the 
universities’ admissions office (AO) route. This was only possible if they attended 
a prestigious high school and/or one that had an AO relationship with the 
university concerned. Lastly, there is the sports scholarship route, whereby 
athletically promising students can attend university irrespective of their academic 
suitability as they have the chance to raise the university’s profile in the popular 
varsity sports circuit. The result is that in some universities as many as 50% of 
their students have not taken any kind of entrance test at all, and those that did 
have taken a test that values memory over ability (McVeigh, 2010, p. 166).

Therefore getting into these types of high schools was, and still is, an 
attractive option for many career-minded university students in Japan as the 
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numbers of school leavers entering university has grown from 23.6% in 1970 to 
48.2% in 1998 according to a UNESCO report (World Education Forum, 2000).  
However getting into those schools was also a challenge and meant that students 
had to pass these schools’ tests, and in turn this involved more juku work and of 
course graduating from a good junior high school and so on down the line to 
kindergarten, with the ubiquitous juku again involved. So this long and arduous 
process extended from kindergarten all the way to entering university. 

University, therefore, was viewed as a rest period between the examination/ 
education hell and the hard work that came afterwards as a corporate samurai 
salariman (a corporate businessman usually paid by monthly salary). As 
universities were seen as a place to have fun (Ellington, 2002, p. 142), students 
tended to focus more on their club activities at university rather than their 
studies. Indeed many students rely on the old-boy network of their university 
clubs to try to gain employment rather than their grades and qualifications. As 
part of this educational “simulation” (McVeigh, 2002, Chapter 6), universities 
were traditionally not expected to give too much work, or to try to shape the 
thinking or character of their students. That was seen as the domain of the 
employers and many Japanese employers preferred their newly graduated 
employees to be “blank slates” that they and they alone could mould, into the 
corporate image and the type of worker they desired (Urata, 1996). This was the 
“educational” model that was in place during Japan’s so-called economic miracle 
period from the 1960s to the mid 1990s and afterwards. However that economic 
period is now over, and Japan’s educational model needs to change as the 
demographic problems in Japan have meant that standards for the entrance tests 
and AO suitability levels have had to drop to enable many universities to stay in 
business. Even this has not been enough to stop 46% of universities operating at 
less than full capacity, and 40% of them are operating and making a loss 
(Tanikawa, 2013). However, in Japan old habits die hard. 

Japanese universities in general now have a large number of older, tenured 
professors that are there until retirement age. Although this is 55 years of age for 
government employees (Aschwanden, 2004), it is 60 for universities and in some 
cases 65 now (Cyranoski, 2000), with 67 for part-time employees. Many of these 
teachers are not up to speed with modern teaching methodologies, pedagogies, 
and technologies as they were hired when such things were relatively 
unimportant, given the “blank slate” model in play when they were hired. Even 
now, it is not uncommon when walking down university corridors to still see 
paper sign-up sheets on professors’ doors for students to use when requesting 
meeting times with their professors and supervisors, and they are mostly blank! 
Also, many more professors were never held accountable for the quality of their 
classes as under the old system this never mattered, and in many universities the 
teachers themselves hand out and collect the student satisfaction surveys in paper 
form, and teachers are responsible for handing them in to the office – a less than 
ethical practice. McVeigh covered much of this in detail when he talked about 
“simulated schooling” in reference to his time teaching at universities in Japan 
(McVeigh, 2002, Chapter 6). Others (Eades et al., 2005) also examine many of 
the diverse challenges facing Japanese universities in the 21st century, and for the 
most part, show how they are not rising to these challenges; and one of my own 
papers (Paterson, 2008) looks at how students can be treated as mere 
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commodities by many universities in the current economic and demographic 
climate in Japan, with little attention paid to teaching quality.

That this low quality of teaching is still ongoing is not just seen from insider 
teacher experiences like mine as even relatively recent generalist books on Japan 
mention this well-known phenomenon (Ellington, 2002, p. 142). It is further 
borne out by the many complaints regarding recent graduates coming from their 
employers in Japan. The OECD even remarked on this in the conclusion to their 
report on education in Japan in 2009:

We believe that the pressures for continued change are unlikely to abate. For 
Japan’s research universities, global competition for highly skilled graduate 
students and faculty will not diminish in the years ahead, and global league tables 
of research performance, however unwelcome, will not recede in importance. 
Demographic pressures now bearing hard on private universities and junior 
colleges cannot be deterred, nor can state intervention be expected to diminish 
the financial challenges they pose. New generations of students, more concerned 
about the link between their studies and working life and newly empowered by a 
shifting balance of demand and supply, may press tertiary institutions for wider 
flexibility in provision and greater relevance in teaching than they have 
heretofore. And, the nation’s business establishment and political leaders appear 
to expect continued movement in the direction of greater agility, openness, and 
resourcefulness from its tertiary institutions. (Newby, Weko, Breneman, 
Johanneson, & Maassen 2009, p. 99)

These “new generations” of students are not enough in number to keep the 
universities in business as normal, so there is also a demand from universities for 
foreign students, yet in general, foreign students only make up around 3.3% of all 
students in Japan, less than half the OECD average (Newby et al., 2009, p. 80).

These university failings are particularly acute in the educational technology 
field as already described above (International Telecommunications Union, 2007). 
In addition some big-name universities still do not have a campus wide Wi-Fi 
network in place; some only have Wi-Fi in some rooms and in some buildings 
only, and frequently without any guest access. Other universities that do have a 
Wi-Fi network have less than robust ones, which are not suitable for large-scale 
deployment, whereby if many students use it simultaneously, the system runs 
slow, or crashes. This is the type of prevailing infrastructure that lead to Japan 
scoring so low on the e-Readiness Index (Suzuki, 2009). 

DIGITAL LITERACY APPROACH 

To date there has been a great deal of research conducted on the importance 
of digital literacy in the modern world (Jones & Hafner, 2012; Knobel & 
Lankshear, 2007; Kress, 2003; Lankshear & Knobel, 2008), and in the 
English-speaking world, there have been calls for formally integrating digital 
literacy into the curriculum at schools (Gee & Hayes, 2011), calls that the 
international schools in Japan seem to have heeded, while the universities have 
not. Furthermore, it is not just educational technology-minded teaching staff that 
are making complaints. I previously had conducted an action research project on 



KOTESOL PROCEEDINGS 2017

Rab Paterson 157

digital literacy classes while I was teaching at International Christian University in 
the English for Liberal Arts program, as ICU’s own internal student surveys of 
graduating senior students showed prior dissatisfaction with their IT/ICT skills 
(ICU, 2005) and the general information literacy weaknesses of students in these 
areas has also been identified at other universities (Burke, 2012; Kolowich, 2011). 
Other ICU students (non-seniors) also rated their IT/ICT knowledge and 
satisfaction lower than all the other categories surveyed as confirmed by ICU’s 
self-study and evaluation report (ICU Self-Study Committee, 2009) in a later 
survey, and these provided the impetus for me to start my research project in the 
area of digital literacy.

The importance of digital literacy for English language learners has, however, 
not attracted as much attention when compared with digital literacy in general, 
with the advanced English learners sector at university receiving even less 
attention. One of the few studies addressing advanced learners (not specifically 
English or university-based learners though) advocates “bridging activities” 
(Thorne & Reinhardt, 2008) that combine language learning with new media and 
technology. So in response to this while teaching at ICU, I piloted the 
introduction of a course using these bridging techniques in my advanced English 
classes to examine students’ reactions to this approach. This paper highlights my 
thought process behind that action research experiment as bridging activities have 
not been researched to any great degree in English in Japan, both because of the 
scarcity of such high-level English students in universities here, and the low levels 
of educational technology integration in education in Japan in general. In addition 
my students were kikokushijo (Japanese children who have received a substantial 
part of their education outside Japan) returnees for the most part, so they were 
very different from the vast majority of Japanese university students (and these 
are the type of internationally minded students that Japan needs to attract if their 
universities are to survive their demographic problems). As these types of students 
are a very under-researched group, especially in terms of their university 
experiences with educational technology content, this justified my research on the 
project.

Many educators have also written about collaborative or participatory-based 
learning (Lewis & Allan, 2004; Nicosia, 2013, Chapter 3), but these have not been 
addressing the case of internationally educated, advanced English language 
learners in Japan as my research project did. Here my research (in this case 
surveys and interviews) was designed to get feedback on the student reactions to 
these collaborative multimedia project-based work from just these types of 
students. The projects themselves were set up according to Salmon’s five-stage 
model for blended learning (Salmon, n.d.). While this is a general design, I 
wanted to explore its suitability for internationally educated, advanced English 
language learners in Japan. 

Overall then, the course I created and was researching aimed to utilize a 
modern digital teaching pedagogy along the lines of the “bridging activities” 
approach as advocated by Thorne and Reinhardt (2008) for Internet 
communication and tools for advanced language learners in general. However, I 
wanted to investigate how suitable this approach is for teaching internationally 
educated, third-culture, advanced English language learners in Japan. Therefore, 
the pedagogical approaches I used were those developed to leverage advances in 
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educational technology for teaching digital/multimedia content as these seemed 
best suited to the bridging theory. 

There are four categories in the bridging approach (Thorne & Reinhardt, 
2008, pp. 536–566). These are “instant messaging” and “synchronous chat,” and 
here Thorne and Reinhardt were more interested in the linguistic conventions 
used by students, whereas I was more interested in whether students used them 
at all, and if so to what extent, which tools and why. Thorne and Reinhardt also 
looked at “blogs” and “wikis” and were interested in whether students 
differentiated between types of blogs, and blogs and other reflective writing, and 
did not mention wiki’s much except for citing Wikipedia as a model. By contrast, 
I was interested in how useful and interesting students found the act of writing a 
blog and reading others’ blogs as part of a community of learners. I also 
examined their feedback on their collaborative efforts as part of their project was 
to build a collaborative multimedia website as an e-portfolio host for their 
coursework output. This leads into Thorne and Reinhardt’s third category: 
“remixing.” They describe this using an example of fanfiction quoting Black 
(2006, 2007, as cited in Thorne & Reinhardt, 2008, p. 565) as describing it as

A practice by which enthusiasts of various media such as books, movies, 
television, comics, and video games borrow elements of these popular cultural 
texts, such as characters, settings, literary tropes and plotlines, to construct their 
own narrative fictions. Fans often remix these various media, combining multiple 
genres languages and cultural elements; for example, Black describes English as a 
second language learners inserting Japanese terms and Asian cultural references 
into Japanese animation or anime-based fanfiction that is written in English and 
set within a North American context. (Thorne & Reinhardt, 2008, p. 565) 

Here there were examples of this in one of the introduction videos my 
students made for their websites as they blended English language singing/song 
writing, human beat-box/hip-hop dancing, and shamisen (a traditional Japanese 
stringed instrument) playing in a musical piece that connected the three research 
themes of those students; namely, the negative effects of corporate influence on 
music in general, its changing of hip-hop style, and lowering of interest in 
traditional Japanese music due to U.S. cultural imperialism. These three students 
agreed to present this at an academic conference on educational technology in 
Japan with me in February 2014 (Paperless – http://paperless2014.weebly.com/) 
and gave permission for Google to use their website at the BETT 
(http://www.bettshow.com/) conference in London in January 2014, so giving the 
URL here poses no ethical problems. The video is on the landing page of their 
project site (https://sites.google.com/site/hiptomusic/). The fourth area Thorne 
and Reinhardt (2008) examined is “multiplayer online gaming.” This played no 
part in my study as my course had no gamification component, as it was unlikely 
such a fun-looking component would have been accepted in my syllabus by the 
largely conservative minds of the Japanese university administrators! 

My students, however, were not so conservative, being the so-called digital 
natives (Prensky, 2001), and although Prensky draws broad conclusions in his 
“digital natives/digital immigrants” thesis, and accordingly has been critiqued for 
not taking into account the older (immigrant) technology-capable researchers that 
built the Internet or the financial divide (rather than age) that underpins the 
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technology gap in many areas, his ideas do have some utility in terms of a 
generational approach to technology concepts rather than actual usage. For digital 
usage, work has been done on Japanese university students’ computer knowledge 
and information literacy (Lockley, 2011; Murray & Blyth, 2011). Murray and Blyth 
found that students were much more experienced and proficient at using 
smartphones than computers (Murray & Blyth, 2011, p. 313). However, these were 
not internationally educated Japanese students, nor were they advanced English 
learners, they were jun-Japa students educated in Japanese schools that are 
low-tech to no-tech environments, as many ban the possession of mobile phones 
(“Ishikawa OK’s kid cell phone ban,” 2009), and non-English majors. So my 
course involved a group that has not been studied before in Japan (at least not in 
this way in this area) to determine their reactions to being taught 
digital/information/multimedia/visual literacy content using a digital pedagogy 
and as part of an online learning community. 

As I recognized the importance of journaling by students as a reflective device 
(Finley, 2010), I started using online blog journals instead of paper-based journals 
to help address this “flipped learning” checking problem (Paterson, 2014, p. 4). In 
my approach, students posted blog entries with their reactions to the “flipped” 
readings or videos conducted at home, not just the class activities, and this has 
lessened the traditional paper journaling problems of timeliness (Paterson, 2014, 
pp. 5–6). These blogs had another benefit over paper journaling as it created an 
online community audience for the blogs, and this has been mentioned by 
students as being beneficial over the years I have been using this approach. This 
is an example of an emerging learning community (see the PLE section below) 
and, in this case, was a “Small Core of Active members – Closed Group” type of 
learning community (Lewis & Allan, 2004, p. 21) as the membership remained 
constant: the class members and me. So I wanted to expose the students’ to being 
members of this ‘community’ and to have them sharing their blogs as this was 
new to most of them. 

Building on blog usage, I adapted the Just-in-Time teaching approach to my 
course needs (Paterson, 2014, pp. 6–7). This is a theoretical teaching approach 
that borrows from the business/management/manufacturing theory of just-in-time 
production made famous by Toyota in the 1990s (Just-in-Time, n.d.), where 
supplies are only ordered when needed to maximize efficiency and reduce costs. 
The educational variation on this is for teachers to give comments and feedback 
“just in time” and when needed to maximize learning and memory retention. 
Therefore, I attempted to replicate this approach as much as possible in my 
course via blogs. In this way, I was using the blog journals to replicate the more 
hi-tech JiTT pre-class survey systems like i-Clicker (https://www1.iclicker.com/ 
student-response-devices) that were not suitable for my course, given the 
technology limitations at ICU. 

With the blogs being public and shared, I wanted the other apps and tools to 
also offer a group function to emphasize the collaborative aspects of learning as I 
was aiming to examine the “community of learners” issue. Therefore, Google Apps 
and Zotero were featured prominently as they both possess these functions over 
and above their basic usage (Firth & Mesureur, 2010). These social aspects of the 
tools also enabled the students to contact each other and their teacher (me) at 
any time, and given the ubiquity of smartphones, they could be reasonably sure of 
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a quick response from each other and me. This is the Expanded Classroom (Shaw, 
2013) where technology enables community-based learning to take place 
everywhere, essentially making the wired (or wireless) world the classroom if 
students connect for classwork via their community. “Expanding the classroom’ 
seemed the obvious way to go as it would enable me to have greater contact with 
the students via email, online chat, Google Groups, and blog comments. These, 
then, are the overarching theories and approaches that underpinned the work I 
did in this research project, the pedagogical strategies I used, and the tools, 
techniques, and skillsets I covered for the purposes of evaluating how well the 
bridging activities worked for my (currently) relatively unique and under- 
researched type of students in Japan. 

CONCLUSIONS

My initial research project was designed to examine how a relatively unusual 
group of Japanese university freshmen students – in this case, the kikokushijo 
advanced English language students in my course – reacted to a course covering 
digital content and taught using a digital pedagogy. More specifically, it was to 
also examine how they adapted and related to the idea of being part of an online 
learning community of enquiry (Lave & Wenger, 1991; Lewis & Allan, 2004) and 
to what extent that impacted their learning experiences. In addition, this study 
also attempted to see if the “bridging activities” theory (Thorne & Reinhardt, 
2008) used for other advanced language learners was also relevant in this digital 
type course setting. 

From detailed interactions with the students over a period of eight months 
(including interviews and surveys over and above coursework and blog reading), 
my students gave an overwhelmingly positive response to this type of class, 
content, and delivery. A few comments here from the anonymous end-of-course 
survey will help illustrate just how well they rated these classes: 

Student Response 2 – the tech-tools are something we can use for a lifetime, 
thus, i think the classes were relevant for our education.

Student Response 4 – That was awesome!!!! There are times I think back on our 
classes and it’s a major relief to know that I can actually contact 
anyone whenever I come up with a cool idea or sth [something]. It’s 
like class is still presuming in your phone.

Student Response 6 – enjoyed every bit of it, it was so stimulating to be with 
many bright, talented, classmates, the content of the class was always 
pushing me which was great!

Student Response 9 – The collaborative learning using Google and other 
technological tools was very useful and enjoyable. I think that Rab 
should hold an independent class just on those things.

Student Response 11 – (these) classes were the only classes this term where I did 
not feel the urge to sleep during class.

Student Response 15 – Best classes I’ve taken in my life. Amazing quality, new 
insight, integrating technology, just fantastic classes.

Student Response 19 – I never thought classes could be this fun interesting, and 
challenging.
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Student Response 21 – These days, it should be NORMAL to have classes in 
rooms filled with computers. Technology plays a huge role in our lives 
today, and I don't see why it should be the same in classrooms. 

Therefore, with technology playing a larger part of people’s lives every day, 
especially in the younger generation’s lives, education has to also evolve with 
these changes to remain relevant to succeeding generations of learners, as 
teachers cannot teach students the way they were taught and expect automatic 
student engagement to happen. Therefore, it is my recommendation that more 
universities in Japan implement these kinds of courses, and sooner rather than 
later, given how long it takes to get teachers up to speed on using these 
approaches and getting them able to use the tools properly. This is especially 
important if Japanese universities wish to attract internationally minded/ 
internationally educated students to offset the decline in student numbers in 
Japan due to the infamously low birth-rates in Japan. It is my prediction that this 
is indeed what will happen and some of the more forward-thinking Japanese 
universities are already starting this approach now. 

So let me finish with this very apt quote:

We need technology in every classroom and in every student and teacher’s hand, 
because it is the pen and paper of our time, and it is the lens through which we 
experience much of our world. (Warlick, 2006) 
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